Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

STATE OF ALLABAMA ) FRANKLIN COUNTY COMMISSION
) REGULAR MEETING
FRANKLIN COUNTY ) DECEMBER 18, 2023 8:30 AM

PRESENT: Honorable Barry Moore, presiding as Judge of Probate and Chairman, and Messrs., Chris
Wallace, Jason Miller, and David Hester as Members.

ALSO PRESENT: Mark Latham of the Franklin County Sheriff*s Office, Solid Waste Manager Gene
Ward, County Engineer Jason Baggett, Assistant County Engineer Caleb Sherill, Mary Scofield, EMA
Director Mary Hallman-Glass, County Administrator Leah Mansell, John Pilati of the Franklin Free
Press, Evan Hargett, John McReynolds,

CALL TO ORDER

Chairman Moore called the meeting to order.

INVOCATION

The meeting was opened in prayer by Member Jason Miller.
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
The Pledge of Allegiance was led by Member David Hester.
ROLL CALL
Chairman Moore stated that all Members are present except Commissioner Baldwin.

PUBLIC COMMENTS

Chairman Moore read a thank you card from the family of former County Attorney Roger
Bedford for sympathy shown during his passing.

Chairman Moore thanked the department heads and county employees for a good year and
wished them a Merry Christmas and Happy New Year.

Commissioner Miller asked County Administrator Leah Mansell give an update on UNA’s
progress with updating the personnel policies, job descriptions and pay scales. Leah stated that UNA has
been working on the job questionnaires to update the job descriptions and they have the Highway
Department’s ready and will continue working on the other departments. She added that it is a slower
process since UNA hasn’t contracted to do this with anyone to this before.

Commissioner Wallace wished County Administrator [.eah Mansell a happy birthday.
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APPROVAL OF AGENDA

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the board to approve the overall agenda.

APPROVAL OF BILLS

It is on motion of Mr. Jason Miller, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve the November bills for payment.

NEW BUSINESS

COMMISSION

PITNEY BOWES POSTAGE METER LEASE

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve the postage meter lease with Pitney Bowes for a period of
36 months.

Lease agreement as follows:



pitney bowes

NASPO ValuePoint Term Rental Installment Agreement (Option A)

Your Business Information T T T T Y e P, E A S Ry

I_Illillll||

Agreement Number

Full Legal Name of Lessee { DBA Name of Lessee

FRANKLIN COUNTY COMM

Tax ID # (FEIN/TIN)

636001544
Sold-To: Address
405 JACKSON AVE N, RUSSELLVILLE, AL, 35653-2346, US
Sold-To: Contact Name Sold-To: Contact Phone # Sold-To: Account #
Leah Mansell (258) 332-8853 0011676144
Bill-To: Address
405 JACKSON AVE N, RUSSELLVILLE, AL, 35653-2346, US
Bill-To: Contact Name Bill-To: Contact Phone # Bill-To: Account # Bill-To: Email
Leah Mansell (256) 332-8853 0011676144 Imansell@hiwaay.net

Ship-To: Address

405 JACKSON AVE N, RUSSELLVILLE, AL, 35653-2348, US

Ship-To: Contact Name Ship-To: Contact Phone #

Leah Mansell (256) 332-8853

Ship=To: Account #
0011676144

PO #

Your Business Needs

Qty Item Business Solution Description
1 SENDPROCAUTO
SendPro C Auto

1 1E48

SP100 Label Printer
1 1FXA

Interface to InView Dashboard
1 7HOO

C Series IMI Meter
1 993-4B

DM400C Return Kit - Upgrade to 9H00
1 APAC

Connect+ Accounting Weight Break Reports
1 APAX

Cost Acctg Accounts Level (100)
1 APKN

Account List Import/Export
1 C5CC

Sendpro C Auto 95
1 CAAB

Basic Cost Accounting
1 COVER-SPCA

Protective Dust Cover - SendPro C Auto
1 ERB4

eReturn Recelpt Subscription - C Series
1 FoDD

USPS Spacial Services Welcome Kit
1 FOPG2 =

PowerGuard LE Service Package
US174887.4 223

©2023 Pitney Bowes Inc. All rights reserved.
Pitney Bowes Confidential Information

Page 1 of3

Y102985818

See Pitney Bowes Terms for additional terms and conditions



i ME1A
Meter Equipment - C Serles
1 MP81{
C Serles Integrated Scale
1 NV50
InVlew Dashboard 1 unlt DM125/DNM225
1 NVa0
InView Subscription
1 NVGOKIT
InVizw Welcome Kit
1 NvS9
InVlew MMS Base Software
1 NVS9KIT
InVlew Welcome Kit
1 PAB1
C Series Premium App Bundiz
1 PTH
SandPro Online-PitnayShip
i PTJA
SPO-PitneyShip Basic 1 User
1 PTJN
Single UUser Access
1 PTK1
Web Browser Integration
1 PTKZ
SendPro C Serles Shipping Integration
1 SJ82
Softguard For SendPro C500
1 STDSLA .
Standard 8l.A-Equipment Service Agreement (for SendPro G Auto)
1 ZH24
Manual Welght Entry
1 ZH29
HZ03 95 LPM Speed
ZHCE
! SendPro C500 Base System Identifier
ZHD5
! USFS Rates with Metered Lelter
1 ZHD7
= Conf Services for Meterad LTR, BDL
1 ZHD8 !
Elactronic Return Recelpt
1 ZHD9
Retait Ground LOR
1 ZHWL
5lb/3kg Weighing Option for MP81

Usi74ea7.4

©2029 Pltnoy Bowes Inc. All rights reserved.
Pitney Bowas Confidentlal Information

Page 2 of 3
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Your Payment Plan __“__—&_—

Initial Term: 36 months Initial Payment Amount: () Tax Exempt Certificate Attached
Number of Months Manthly Amount Billed Quarterly at* () Tax Exempt Certificate Not Required
36 $229.96 $ 689.88 () Purchase Power® transaction fees included

(X) Purchase Power® transaction fees extra
*Duoes not include any applicable sales, use, or property taxes which will be billed separately.
if the equipment listed above is replacing Your current meter, your curent meter will be taken out of service once this lease commences.

Your Signature Below

By signing below, you agree to be bound by your State's/Entity’s/Cooperative’s contract, which is available at 3 i
conditions of this contract will govern this transaction and be binding on us after we have completed our credit and documentation

included in the Order, additional terms apply which are either (i) included in your State's contract which is available at hiip-
for that software located at https: aluepaint.org/search/?term=pitney+bowes = T

ates and is incorporated by reference. The terms and
approval process and have signed below. If software is

or (i) available by clicking on the hyperlink
rs. Those additional terms are incorporated by reference.

NASPO VALUEPOINT CTR058808;
State/Entity's Conlract#

Lgeis’gnaw"e wre Pifney Bowes Signatura
Fc Nai ei P-nnt Name

12 118] 2023
Tmansell® Niwaay net

Email Address

Sales Information ____h_i

S s A e
Lynn Harrington lynn.harrington@pb.com

Account Rep Name Email Address PBGFS Acceptance

Us174887.4 2/23 Page 3 of 3 Y102985818
©2023 Pitney Bowes Inc. All rights reserved, See Pitney Bowes Terms for additional terms and. conditions
Pitney Bowes Confidential Information



information Return for Small Tax-Exempt
rom §038-GC  Governmental Bond Issues, Leases, and Installment Sales

Under Internal Revenue Code sectlon 149(e)
{Rav. Octaber 2021)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revanue Sarvice

Caution: if the Issus price of the Issue Is §1 00,600 or more, usa Form 8038-G.
Go to www.irs.goviForm8038GC for Instructions and the latest fnformatlon,

OMB No. 1845-0047

Reporting Authorlty

Check box if Amanded Return I___|

1 Issuers name

FRANKLIN COUNTY COMM

2 [ssuer's employer Identification number (EIN)

636001544

3 Number and strest {or P.C. box If mall is not delivered [o streat address)

A06 JACKSON AVE N

Reom/suile

4 Cliy, town, or post cffice, stale, and ZIP code

RUSSELLVILLE Al 35653-2348

5 Reportnumber (For IRS Use Oniy)

b
8 Name and title of officer or olher employas of iasuer or designated contact persan wham the IRS may call for mors Infermation | 7 Telephone number of officer or legal

raprasantative

Pairt !l Description of Obligatlons Cheack one box: Singleissue [] Consolidated retum O

Ba lssue price of obligation(s) (see fnstructions) . . ..., ..

lssue date (singla issue) or calendar date {consolldated). Enter date in mm/ddAyyy format (for

example, 01/01/2009} (see Instructions)
Armount of the reported abligation{s) on line 8a that Is:
Forlgasesforvehicles . ... ... ... .. ......... . ..

w

Forleasesforrealproperty . . .. ... ... ..............
For lsases for other (see Instructions)
Forbank loansforvehicles . . .. ... . ... ... ..........

For bank loans for office equipment . . . . .. .. .., L.,
ForbankJoans forrealproperty. . .. . . ... ............. .

For bank loans for olher {sae Instructions} . . . .. .. ... ... ..... .
Usedtorefund priorfssue(s) ... .................. . .

XU STaeoe oo o

Other . . . ..o

Reprasenting a loan from the proceads of another tax-exernpt obfigation (for example, bond bank) . .

10. If the issuer has designated any lssue under section 285(b)(3)(BYIMM) (small issuer axception), check this box . . ., . |
11 [fthe issuer has olected fo pay a penalty In lleu of arhitrage rebate, check this hox (sea instructions}. . .. . .. Im |

12 Vendor's orbank's name:  ___ | Pitney Bowes Inc.

13 Vendor's or bank's employer idenfification numbar 06 0495050

Si ghature | s return, o the parson(s) that | have authorized abovae,

Under panalties of perury, | dactars that | have examined this relurn and accompanying schediles and stalements, and lo the bast of my knowledge and
bellef, thay are Irue, corract, and camplete. | further declare that | cansent to the IRS's disclosura of the lssuer's return Information, as necassary to procass

and
Consent r
Signaturgfof i Type or print nama ghd titls
. A
Paid PrintTypa preparer's name Preparer's slgnature Dale Check L—,,] if| PTIN
Pre parer self-amployead
Use Only | _Fim's name Firm's EIN
Firm's addrass Phona no.

Future Developments

For the latast informatlon aboui developments
related o Form 8038-GC and its Instructions,
such as |egisfation enacted after they were
publishad, go to www.irs, gov/Form8038GC,

General Instructions

Secilon rsfarences are fo the Internal
Ravenue Code tniess otherwise noted

Purpose of Form

Form 8038-GC is usad by the Issuers of tax-
exempt governmental obligations to provide
the IRS with the Informaticn required by
section 149(a) and to monitor the
requirements of sections 141 through 450.

Who Must File

Issuars of tax-exempt governmental
obligations with Issue prices of less than
$100,000 must file Form 8038-GC.

Issuets of a tax-exempt governmental
obligation with an Issue price of $100,000 or
more must fle Form 8038-G, Information
Return for Tax-Exempt Governmental Bonds.

Fillng a separate roturn fora single Issue.
Issuers have the option to file a separate
Form 8038-GC for any tax-exempt
governmental obllgation with an Issue price
of less than $100,000.

An issuer of a tax-exempt bond used to
finance constructlon expendiures must fla a
separate Form 8038-GC for sach Issue to give
notlce to the IRS that an election was mada to

pay a penalty in lisu of arblirags rebats. See
the Instructions for line 11, later.

Filing a consolldated refurn for multiple
issues. For all tax-exempt governmantal
obligations with issue prlces of less than
$100,000 that are not reported on a separata
Form 8038-GC, an issuer nustflle a
conselidated infarmation return including ail
such jssues issued within the calendar yoar,

Thus, an issuer may file a separata Form
8038-GG for each of a number of small issues
and report the remainder of small Issues
issued during the calsndar year on one
consolidated Form 8038-GC. Howsver, If the
Issus is a conslruction lssus, a soparate Form
8038-GC must be filed to give the IRS notice
af the electlon to pay a panalty In lleu
of arbitrage rebate.

For Paperwork Reduction Act Notles, see Instructions.

Cat, No. 641088

Form 8038-GC (Rev. 10-2021)



Form 8038-GC (Rev. 10-2021}

When To File

To file a saparate return for a single lssus, flls
Form 8028-GC on or before the 15th day of
the second calandar month after the closs of
the calendar quarter in which the Issue fs
issued,

To fila a consolidated return for multiple
Issues, file Form 8038-GC on or before
February 15 of the calendar vear fellowing
the year In which the Issua |s lssued,

Late fillng. An Issuer may be granted an
extenslon of time to file Form 8038-Go undar
seation 3 of Rev, Proc, 2002-48, 2002-37
|.R.B. 531, if it is determinad that the failura fo

file on tlme Isn't due to willy;] neglect. Write at the

top of the form, "Request for

Rellef under sectlon 3 of Rav. Proc, 2002-48."
Altach to the Form 8038-GC a Jalter briefly
stating why the form was not submitted to the
IRS on time. Also indlcate whether the
obligation in question Is under examination by
the IRS. Do not submit coples of any bond
documents, leases, or Installment sala
documents. Ses Where To Filo next.

Where To File

Fllz Form 8038-GC and any attachments at the
followlng address,

Bepartment of the Treasury

Internal Revenue Service Genter

Qgden, UT 84201

Private delivery services(PDS). You can use
certaln PDS designated by the IRS to maat the
“timely malling as tirmaly fillng/payling rule

for fax retums and payments. These PDS
Include cnly the following:

+ DHL Express {DHL): DHL Same Day Service.

* Federal Express (Fad Ex): FedEx Priority
Ovarnight, FedEx Standard Overnight, FedFx
2Day, FedEx Intarnational Priority, and
FedEx International First,

* United Parcel Servics (UPS}: UPS Next Day
Alr, UPS Next Day Alr Baver, UPS Znd Day Air,
UPS 2nd Day Alr AM., UPS Worldwida Express
Flus, and UPS Worldwide Express.

The PDS can tell you
how ta get written groof of the mailing date,

Other Forms That May Be
Required

For rebating arsitrage {or paylng a penalty In
lieu of arbitrage rebate) o the Federal
Government, use Form 8038-T, Arbitrage
Rabats, Yield Reduction; and Penalty In Lieu
of Arbitrage Rebate, For private activity
bonds, use Form 8038, Information Retuin for
Tax-Exempt Private Activity Bond Issyes,

For a tax-exempt governmantal obllgation
with an Issue prics of $100,000 or more, use
Form 8038-G,

Rounding to Whote Dollars

You may show the maoney lteme on this retum
s whols-dollar amounts. To do 80, drop any
amount less than 5 cents and increase any
amount from 50 to 95 cents to the next higher
dellar.For example, $1.49 bacomes 51 and
$2.50 becomes $3. If two or more amounts
rmust be added to figure the amount o anter
on & line, indude cents when add ng the
ameunts and round off only the tatal,

Definitions

Obligations. This refers to g single tax-
axempt governmental obligation if Form
8038-GC [s used for separate raporting or fo
multiple tax-exempt governmental obilgations
if the form Is used ‘or consclidated raporting,

Tax-axempt obligation, This s any obligation
including a bond, Installment purchase
agreament, or financlal lease, on which the
Interest is excluded from Income under section
103,

Tax-exempt governmental obligation. A tax
exempt obligation that Isnt a private acilvity
bond(ses balow) Js a tax-exempt governmental
obilgation. This includes a bong Issued by a
qualified volunteer fire departmsnt under
saction 150(e).

Private activity bond. This Includes an
obligation Issued as part of an lssus In which;
* More than 10% of the proceeds are to be
used for any privaie activity business use, and

* More than 10% of the payment of principal
or interest of the Issuis Is sfther (a) sacured by
an Inferest in property to bs used for a privats
business use (or Payiments for such propart )
or (b) to be derived from payments for :
property {or borrowed monsy) used for a
private business uss,

It also Jncludes a bond, the proceeds of
which (a) are to be used o make ot finance
loans (other than loans desarlbed in seotion
141(e)(2)} to persons other than
governmental units and {t} sxcesds the
lessar of 5% of the praceeds or $5 milllon.

Issue, Generally, obligatlons are treatsd as
pait of the same Issue only If they are lssued
by the same issuer, on the sama date, and as
part of a single transacticn, or a serles of
related transactons, However, obligations
issued during the same calendar year (a)
under a loan agreement undar which amounts
are 1o be advanced perlodically {a "draw-down
loan"y or {i) with & term not excaeding 270
days, may be treated as part of the same
lssue If the obligations arg equally and ratably
ssatred under a single Indanture or loan
agreemsnt and are Issuad under g comimon
financing arrangement {for example, under the
&ame official statement periodically updated to
refloct changing factual circumstances). Also,
for cbllgations Issued undar a draw-down lcan
that mests the requirements of the praced| Ing
sentenes, obiigations issued durlng different
calendar yaars may be treated as: pait of the
same Issue if all of the amounts ko be
advanced Under the draw-down loan are
reasonably expected to be advancsed within 3
years of the date of Issiia of the first
obligation, Likewisa, obligaticns (other than
private activity bands) Issued under g singie
agreement that is In the form of a lease o
instaliment sale may be treated as part of the
same Issue If all of the broperty covered by
that agreement is reasonably expected to be
dellvered within 3 years of the date of [ssue of
the first obligation,

Arbitrage rebata, Generally, interest on a
state or Jocal hond Is not tax-exempt unless
the Issuar of the bond rebates to tha United
States arblirage profits earnsd from Investing
proceeds of the bond In higher yielding
nonpurpose Investments.See section 1 48{7).
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Construction issue, This js an Issue of tax-
exempt bonds that meets both of the
following conditions:

1. Atleast 75% of the avaflable construction
proceeds of the Issue are fo ba ysed for
construction expenditures with respect to
properly to be owned by & governmental yn|t
ora §01(c){3) crganization, and

2. Al of the bonds that are part of the issue
are qualified 501(c)(3) bonds, bonds that ara
not private aclivity bends, or private acilvlty
bords lssued to financa properly to ha owned
by a governmental unlt or a 801(c)(3)
organization,

In lleu of rebating any arbitrags that may be
owed to the United Slataes, the issuer of g
conslruction Issue may make an irrevocable
slection to pay a Penalty. The penalty is equal
te 1-1/2% of the amount of construction
praceads that do not mest certain spandin
requirements. See ssction 148(F{4)(C) and
tha Instructions for Form 8036-T,

Specific Instructions

In general, a Form 8038-GC must be
completed en the basls of avallable
infarmation and reasonabis expectations g5 of
the date of issua, However, forms that are flled
on a consclldated basls may be completad an
the basis of Information readily available to the
Issuer at the close of the calendar year to
which the form relatss, supplamented by
eslimates mads In good faith,

Part |I—Reporting Authority

Amended return., An lssuer may fils an
amended return to change or add to the
Informatlon raported on 5 previously filad
retum for the same date of Issue, If you ars
flling to correct errors or change a Previously
filed return, check the Amended Rettirn box
in the heading of the form,

The amended raturn must provide ail the
Information reported on the orlglnal return, In
addltion to the new correctag Information,
Attach an explanation of the reason for the
amanded return and write across the top
"Amended Returp Explanation,”

Line 1. The Issuer's nama s the name of the
enfity Issuing the obligations, not the name of
the entity receiving the banefit of the
firancing. In the case of lease or Installmant
sale, the Issuer Is the logsee or purchaser,

Line 2. An issuer that does not have an
emplayer identification number {EIN) shauld
apply for one onllne by visting the IRS
website at vww.Irs. goviEIN, The Organlzation
may also apply for an EIN by faxing or malling
Form $8+4 to the IRS.

Lines 3 and 4. Entertha Issuer's address or
the address of the designated contact parson
listed on line 8, If the Issver wishes to uss jtz
own address and the Issuer recelves Its mall
in care of a third party authorizad
reprasentative (such as an accountant or
altorney), enter on the street address line
“CI0" followsd by the thirg party's name and
street address or PO, box. Include the sulte,
room, or ottier unlt number after te street
address, If tha post office does not dellver ms|
to the streat address and the lssusr has a
P.O, box, show the box number instead of the
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street address. If a changs In address cacurs
after the return Is filed, use Form 8822,
Change of Address, to notify the IRS of the
naw address.

Note. The address entered on nes 3 and 4ls
the address the IRS will use for ail writtan
communications regarding the processing of
this return, Including any notlces. By
authorizing a persen other than an authorized
officer or other employes of the issuer to
communicate with the IRS and whom the IRS
may contact about thls return, the lssuer
authorizes the IRS to communlcats directly
with the Individual llsted on line 8, whose
address Is entered on lines 3 and 4 and
cansents to disclose the Issuer's retumn
Infarmation to that Individual, zs necessary, to
process thls raturn.

Line 5. This line Is for IRS use only. Don't
make any entrias in this box,

Part l—-Descriptlon of Obllgations

Check the apprapriate box daslgnating this as 5
return on a slngle issue bagls or
a consolidated return basis,

Line 8a. The tssue price of obllgations is
generally determined under Regulations
seation 1,148-1(b). Thus, when lssued for
cash, the ssue prics Is the price at which a
substantial amount of tha obllgations ars sold
to the public. To determine the Issue price of
an obifgation Issued for preperty, see sactione
1273 and 1274 and the related regulations.

Line Bh, Fera slngle Issue, enter the date of
Issue (for example, 03/15/2010 for 5 single
Issue Issued on March 15, 2010}, generaliy
the date on which the issuer physleally
exchanges the bonds that are part of tha
lesie for the underwriter's (or other
purchaser's) funds; for a lease or install ment
sale, enter the date Inlerest starts to acerue.
For issues reported on a consolldated basls,
enter the first day of the calendar yeat durlng
which the cbligations wers issued (for
example, for calendar year 201 0, enter
1/01/2010).

Lines %a through 9h, Complete this section if
propeity ofher than cash Is exchanged for the
obligation, for example, acqulring a police car,
a fire truck, or telephone equlpment through &
seties of monthly payments. (This type of
obligatlon is sometimas referred to as a
“munlclpal lease,") Also complete this section
if real property Is directly acquired In exchange
for an cbligafion to meke pericdic payments of
Interest and principal,

Don't complate lines 9a through 9d if the
precasds of an obligation are received In the
form of cash evan If the tanm "lease” s usad
in the title of the issus. For lines 8a through
9d, enter the amount on the appropriate line
that represants a lease or installment

purchase, For line 9¢, anter the type ofitem
thet Is leased, For lines S through 9h, enter
the amount on the appropriate (Ine that
feprasents & bank loan, For line 8h, enter the
type of bank loan,

Lines 9tand 9., Forline 91, enter tha amount
of the proceeds that will be used to pay
principal, Intsrest, or gall premium cn any
other fesue of bonds, including proceads that
Wit be used to fund an ascrow account for
this purpose. Sevsral lines may apply to a
particular obligation, For example, report on
linas 8 and 9) obligations vsed to refund prior
issues which represent loans from the
proceeds of another {ax-exempt oblligation,

Lines 9k. Enter on line 9k the amount on line
8a that does not rapresent an obligation
descrlbad on lines 9a th rough g

Line 10. Check this box i the Issuer has
designaled any Issue as n “small issuer
exceplion” under sectlon 265(L)3)BYI(N).

Line 11. Check ths bax If the lssye lsa
construction Issue and an Irrevocable elaction
to pay a penalty In lley of arbitrage rebate has
been made on or befors the date the bonds
were Issued. The penalty Is payable with a
Form 8038-T for sach 8-month perlod aftar
the date the bonds are ssued. Do not make
any payment of penalty In lleu of rebats with
Form 8038-GC. See Rav. Poc, 92-22 19921
C.B, 736, for rules regarding tha “slection
decument.”

Line 12. Enter the name of ihe vender or bank
whoiis a party to the Installment purchasa
agreament, loan, or financlal jcase. If thare
are multiple vendors or banks, ths lssuer
should attach a schadula,

Line 13, Enter the employer ldentification
number of the vendor or bank who |s 2 party
to the nstallment purchase agreement, loan,
or financlal tease. If there are multiple vendors
or banks, the fssuer shou!d altach a schedula,

Signature and Consent

An autherized representative of the lssuer
must slgn Form 8038-GC and any applicable
ceitification. Also print the name and titla of
the parson slgning Farm 8038-GC. The
authorized representative of the lasyer signing
this form must have the authority to consent to
the disclosurs of the issuar's return
Information, as necessary to process this
ratuim, to the person(s) that has been
designated in this form,

Note. If tha Issuer authorizes In ling 6 the

IR to communicate with 5 person other than
an officer or other employae of the Issuer,
{stch authorization shall include contact both
In writing regardless of the address entered

In lines 3 and 4, and by telephona) by signing
this form, the kssuer's authorlzed
representativa consents to the disclosure

of the lssiier's return Information, as necessary
to process this retumn, to such person.

Paid Preparer

if an authorlzed representative of the {ssuar
filled in its return, the pald preparer's space
should remain blank. Anyone who prepares
the return but does not charge

the organization should not slgn tha return,
Cartain others who prepare the return should
not slgn, For example, a ragular, full-time
employse of the Issuer, stichas a clerk,
sacretayy, ete., should not sign,

Ganerally, anyone who ls pald to prepare a
return must sign It and fill in the other blanks In
the Paid Praparer Uss Only area of the return,
A pald preparer cannot use a social security
number ir the.Pald Preparer Use Only box,
The pald preparer must yse a preparar tax
Identification number (PTINY. if the pald
praparer is seif-smployed, tha preparer should
entar his or her address In the box,

The pald preparar must:

* 8lgn the return in the space provided for the
preparar's signature, and

* Glve a copy of ths return to the lssuer,

Paperwork Reduction Act Notice

We ask for the Information on this form to
cary out the Internal Revanue laws of the
United States, You are regulred to give us the
information, We need it to ensure that you ara
complylng with these laws.

You are not requlred to provide the
Information requested on a form that is
subject to the Paperwork Reduction Act
unless the form displays & valid OMB contro!
number. Books or records relating to a form
or its Instructions must be retained as long as
thelr contents may bacome meteral in the
adminlstration of any Internal Revenue law,

Ganerally, tax returns and retym Informatian
are confldential, as requlrad by section 6103,

The tme needed to complets and fiie this
form will vary depending on Indlvidual
circumstances. The estimated burden for tax
exempt erganizatlons filing this form Is
approvad under OMB contro! numper
1845-0047 and Is Included In the estimates
shown in the hstructions for thelr Informatlon
retum,

If you have suggestions for maklng this
form simpler, we wouild be happy to hear from
YOU. You oan send us comments through
www.Irs.gov/FormComments. Or ¥Ou can
wiite to;

Internal Ravenue Service
Tax Forma and Publications
1111 Gonsitution  Ave, NW, |R-6526
Washington,DC 20224
Do not ssnd Form 8038-GG o this
address. Inatead, see Where To F Ila, eatller.



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

CORONER

BUDGET AMENDMENT

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the board to approve the budget amendments for the Coroner’s office.

Budget amendment as follows:



Budget Revision Request
Franklin County

Budget Year 2023 - ZOZL}
Department C,O\’Ohef

Contact Name Qh(]_,( \CS }AEO{U)X
Title/Position (\,Oﬂ)n?/f

Line Item Line Item Approved Requested Revised
Number Description Amount Amount Amount
00-4101 | Dther Revenue 100.00 [+ 2550.00| 2050.00

00} - 52400- 240 Registation Fees | 5SD.0D |+ 2180.00 | 2730.00
(- 524040 Mysc. Supplies 3000.00 |+ 37000 | 3370.00

Please list below the total amount that the entire budget was approved for (not the sum of the “approved amount” column for
the line items listed above). The +/- amendments’ below is the sum of the “requested amendments” column above. Do not

add any other columns. The ‘revised budget’ below is the sum of the total budget amount below the +/- the sum of the
amendments.

The purpose of the section below is to reflect how this revision request will change the entire budget.

Total Budget +/- Amendments Revised Budget

Reason(s)

FICOC Grant for (tcords System t bodlybags.

Signature 7%:/ 72/‘* Date / L“//ﬂc" 2’)

Date Annraved hv Calintvy Cammiccinn



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

EMA

BUDGET AMENDMENT

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. David Hester, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the board to approve the budget amendments for EMA.

Budget amendment as follows:



Budget Revision Request
Franklin County

Budget Year 2-023' 202‘—‘-

Department EM A

Contact NameJV\a.m G”IQSS

Title/Position EMX D\( QC{VOY’

Number Description Amount Amount

OD-4A003 | Reiob. - Tos. Cloting 25, 0000 £3)U45.30
W~ 523007340 ep. 10 Motor Veh. | 3000.00 |+ 3145 30

Line Item Line ltem Approved Requested Revised

Amount
148,30

45,30

the line items listed above). The +/- amendments’ below is the sum of the “

add any other columns. The ‘revised budget’ below is the sum of the total b
amendments.

The purpose of the section below is to reflect how this revision request will change the entire budget.

‘: Total Budget

Reason(s)

Revised Budget

pproved amount” column for
requested amendments” column above. Do not
udget amount below the +/- the sum of the

Iwance Check 40 yepaic Fasp

Signature %} /’\"’—' Date /2"‘/3"

e

Date Approved by County Commission _



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

CLEM SALARY INCREASE

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the board to approve the salary increase for the CLEM certification for EMA
Director Mary Hallman-Glass.

Certification as follows:



STATE OFALABAMA
EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY

5898 COUNTY ROAD 4L » P.O.DRAWER 2160 » CLANTON, ALABAMA 35046-2160

£ (205) 2802200 FAX #.(205) 280-2495
TS mols
KAY IVEY IEFF.SMITHERMAN
‘GOVERNOR DIRECTOR
November 2, 2023

Mrs. Mary Haliman-Glass

Director

Franklin County Emergency Management Agency
12951 Highway 187 '
Russellville, AL 35653

Dear Mrs. Hallman-Glass,

Congratulations! Your certification information has been reviewed and fourid to be
complete as required by Act 2007-462.. You may now present yourself as a Cerlified
Local Emergency Manager (CLEM) by the standards established to promote
professionalism for the local emergency management directors in the State of Alabama,
(Ala. Code §31-9-61, et. seq.)

S-i‘ncer_ely,
A ditee
Jeff Smitherman

Director, Alabama Emergency Management Agency

Copyto:  AEMA Finance Division |
AEMA Field Operations Division F Coordinator
AEMA Training Section File



FRANKLIN County COMMISSION P ioors Cliiman

Chris Wallace, District I
P.O. Box 1028 » RusseLLviLLg, AL 35653

Jason Miller, District IT
PHONE (256) 332-8850 « Fax (256) 332-8855 Joseph Baldwin, District IIT

David Hester, District IV
Leah Mansell, Administrator

December 1, 2023

Alabama Emergency Management Agency
. Accounting Fiscal Division

Franklin County requests reimbursement of salary for CLEM certified Franklin County EMA

Director Mary Hallman-Glass in the amount of $16,627.52 for FY2024. Please contact me with
any questions at (256)332-8850.

Sincerely,
Leah Mansell

County Administrator
Franklin County Commission



Supplemental Claim Form

To: Alabama Emergency Management Agency

Grant No. 24TGLEM |

From: Grantee: Franklin County e_EMA s "
Accounting - Fiscal Division Grantee's Address PO.Boxf028 . .
Russellville, AL 35653 |
This claim covers for the period Contact Person: '-Leah Mansell e
FY 2024 Phone Number: (256)332-8850 5 |
Code Description Annual Salary 35% or $17,000
E Salaries 47,507.20 16,627.52
% Share 100%
3 16,627.52
TOTAL REQUESTED

FOR AEMA ACCT USE ONLY

State CLEM

Voucher #
Date

The signature below validates that the information provided
above is correct and accurate.

Ww, a)D

d (Signed) Director/Coordinator

Manaell

)l 2w



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

2024 ANNUAL MATERIAL BIDS

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. David Hester, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the board to approve the 2024 annual material bids per recommendations by
the County Engineer Jason Baggett,

Bid resuls as follows:



COUNTY ENGINEER

TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
lason Baggett

EMAIL - jasonb@franklincountyal.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.O.BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave,
Russellville, AL 35653

RE:  Recommendation for Bid Award
Coarse Aggregate (Jobsite and Plant)

Dear Sir:
This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder, Vulcan,

Inc. It should be noted that, according to the specifications for this bid, Franklin County reserves the right

to purchase aggregate from other suppliers based on the lowest cost for materials hauled to a given jobsite,
This bid will be effective January 1 through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

Jason Baggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FF{ANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

I
TABULATION SHEET FOR: COARSE AGGREGATE

BID DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 2:00 pm

EFFECTIVE DATE: January 1 through December 31, 2024
Vulcan Rogers SRM

Materials | Group Concrete
ALDOT #2 Unwashed Limestone
Prica Per Ton FOB Plant $15.75 NOBID { NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NO BID
ALDOT #6 Washed Limestons
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $15.75 NOBID | NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jabsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT #7 Washed Limestone
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $16.25 NC BID | NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT #78 Washed Limestone
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $16.25 NOBID | NORBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT %89 Washad Limestone
Price Pet Ton FOB Plant $16.25 NOBID | NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT #57 Washed Limestone :
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $15.25 NOBID [ NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT Crusher Run Base/Crusher Run
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $14.00 NOBID | NOBID -
Price Per Ton FOB Jahsite NO BID NOBID { NOBID
ALDOT Class 1, Rip Rap Size #10-100 Ihs
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $17.25 NOBID | NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsita NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT Class 2, Rip Rap, Size # 10-200 Ibs
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $17.25 NOBID | NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
ALDOT Quarry Run, Rip Rap
Price Per Ton FOB Plant $16.25 NOBID | NOBID
Piice Per Ton FOB Jobsite NQO BID NOBID | NOBID




" JALDOT Surge Rock

Price Per Ton FOB Plant $16.25 NOBID § NOBID
Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID
Vulcan Rogers SRM

Materials Group | Concrete

ALDOT Gabion Stone

Price Per Ton FOB Plant $17.25 NOBID | NOBID

Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID

ALDOT Manufactured Sand

Ptice Per Ton FOB Plant $15.75 NOBID { NOBID

Price Per Ton FOB Jobsite NO BID NOBID | NOBID

ALDOT CRUSHED AGG, SEC 825 PUG MIX

Price Par Ton FOB Plant $14.00 NOBID | NOBID

Price Per Tan FOB Jobsite NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |




COUNTY ENGINEER
Jason Baggett

TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
EMAIL - jasonb@franklincountyal.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.0.BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.,
Russellville, AL 35653

RE: Recommendation for Bid Award
Cold Mix

Dear Sir:
This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,
which is Advanced Asphalt (Jobsite & Plant) as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. This bid will be

effective January 1 through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

N

Jasdp Baggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



Tabulation Sheet for: OFF-SITE MIXED COLD

Bid Date: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 2:00 pm!

Effective Date: January 1 through Dacember 31, 2024

Cold Mix
Plant Unit
Advanced Asphalt Products $89.00 Ton
APAC NO BID Ton
Wiregrass LATE BID Ton

Rogers Group $250.00 Ton




COUNTY ENGINEER

, : TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
Jason Baggett | 3

EMAIL-jasonb@franklfncountyal.org

A\ N/
oS ‘S‘ '

Franklin County Highway Department
P.0O. BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.
Russellville, AL 35653

RE:  Recommendation for Bid Award
Emulsified Bituminous Materials (Asphalt)
CRS-2 & CRS-2P

Dear Sir:

This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,

which is Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. This bid will be effective
January | through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

Jason Baggett, PE
Franklin County

PC: File

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FRANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION SHEET FOR: EMULSIFIED ASPHALT

BID DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 5:00 p.m.

EFFECTIVE DATE: January 1 through December 31, 2024

ltem 1-3 | Item 1-4 | Hem 1-5 Max
Detention| Time
CRS-2 CRS-2P | Time Cost| Allowed

nits Per Gal |Per Gal Per Hour Hours
Hunt Refining Gai $2.57 $2.97 $75.00 2
Vulcan Marketing, LLC Gal $2.64 $2.96 $75.00 2
Ergon Inc. Gal $2.54 $2.88 $85.00 2

NOTE:

Emulsified Asphalt Index for November 2023




COUNTY ENGINEER

; TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
Jason Baggett

EMAIL - jasonb@franklincountyal.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.0.BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.
Russellville, AL 35653

RE: Recommendation for Bid Award
Corrugated Metal Pipe

Dear Sir:
This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,
which is Fallin Farms DBA Harvey Culvert as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. This bid will be

effective January 1 through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

e

Jas aggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FRANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION SHEET FOR GALVANIZED CMP

BiD DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 2:00 pm

Effective: January 1 through December 31, 2024

FALLIN
ADCO FARMS J&G A&l

1D Size Gage

2100 12" 16 (.064) $18.01 $16.18 $19.40 NO BID
2102 12" Band 16 (.064) $18.01 $24.50 $19.40- NO BID
2103 15" 16 (.064) $22,20 $20.13 $23.28 NO BID
2104 15" Band 16 (.064) $22.22 $40.00 $23.28 NO BID
2105 18" 16 (.064) $26.91 $24,09 $29.10 NO BID
2106 18" Band 16 (.064) $26.91 $48.10 $29.10 NO BID
2107 24" 14 (.079) $42.80 (Special Orcler) $39.85 $46.56 NO BID
2108 24" Band 14 (.079) $42.80 (Special Order) $62.00 $46.56 NO BID
2109 30" {079} $53.57 (Special Order $49.60 $58.20 NO BID
2110 30" Band 4 (.079) $53.57 (Special Order $80.00 $58.20 NO BID
2111 36" 12 (,109) $86.19 (Special Order) $77.00 $95.06 NO BID
2112 36" Band 12 (.109 $86.19 (Special Ordar) $91.00 $95.06 NO BID
2113 42" {.109) $100.29 (Special Order) $90.00 $110.58 NO BID
2114 42" Band 109) | $100.29 (Special Order)| $107.35 $110.58 NO BID
2115 48" 12 (.109) $114.60 (Special Order) $107.71 $126.10 NO BID
2116 48" Band 12 (L109) $114.60 {Special Ordar) $122.54 $126.10 NO BID
2117 54" {.109) $137.62 (Special Order) | $118.30 $141.62 NO BID
2118 54" Band 109) $137.62 (Special Order) $148.66 $141.62 NO BID
2119 60" 12 (.108) $152.31 (Special Order} $143.19 $178.48 NO BID
2120 80" Band 12 (1109 $152.31 (Special Order) $165.04 $178.48 NO BID
2121 72" 10 {.138) NO BID $225,41 $271.60 NO BID
2122 72" Band 10 (.138) NO BID $204.00 $271.60 NO BID
2123 84" 10 (.138) NO BID $279.81 $318.16 NO BID
2124 84" Band 10 (.138) NO BID $317.84 $318.16 NO BID
2125 96" 10 (.138) NO BID $319.21 $364.72 NO BID
2126 96" Band 10 (.138) NO BID $362.58 $364.72 NO BID

NOTE: J&G delivery fee of $100.00 for orders under $2500,00

NOTE: Fallin Farms additional $15.00 for Lifting Lugs




COUNTY ENGINEER

TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
Jason Baggett

EMAIL—jasonb@franklincountyal.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.O. BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.
Russellville, AL 35653

RE:  Recommendation for Bid Award
HDPE Plastic Pipe

Dear Sir;

This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,

which is ADCO Pipe & Supply, LLC as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. This bid will be effective
January 1 through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

Jasoh Baggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FRANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
TABULATION SHEET FOR HDF!E PLASTIC PIPE
BID DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 2:00 p.m.
Effective: January 1 throtg@ecember, 31, 2024
G&O
Failin Farms ADCO J&G A&L Supply
Harvey Culverts| Pipe & Supply | Company Company: | Company
Diameter Price/LF Price/LF Price/LF Price/LF | Price/LF
12" $8.00 $7.37 $7.42 NO BID NO BID
15" $10.86 $9.65 $9.70 NC BID NO BID
18" $14.17 $13.35 $13.40 NO BID NO BID
24" $24.98 $23.50 $23.55 NO-BID NO BID
30" $36.00 $31.85 $31.90 NO BID NO BID
36" $48.61 $42.80 $42.82 NC BID NO BID
427 $62.46 $55.40 $5545 | NOBID | NOBID
48" $79.21 $69.90 $69.95 NQ BID NO BID
54" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" $138.10 $149.90 $149.95 NO BID NO BID

NOTE: J&G Delivery fee of $100.00 for orders under $2500.00.



COUNTY ENGINEER
Jason Baggett

TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
EMAIL ~jasonb@franklincountyal.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.O. BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 11, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.
Russellville, AL 35653

RE:  Recommendation for Bid Award
Plant Mix with Rap (FOB Plant)

Dear Sir:

This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,
Rogers Group, Inc. and APAC-Alabama, Inc. as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. It should be
noted that, according to the specifications for this bid, Franklin County reserves the right to purchase
plant mix from other suppliers based on the lowest cost for materials hauled to a given Jobsite. This bid
will be effective January 1 through December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

Rt

Jasdp/Baggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FRANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPT.

l
BID TABULATION SHEET FOR Hot Bituminous Pavement (FOB Piant)

l

BID DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 2:00 p.m.
|
EFFECTIVE: January 1 through December 31, 2024
Mid-
Rogers South
ITEM NO. Description UNIT Group Paving
4247 Bitiuminous Concrate ton $74.00 $73.00
(1/2" Wearing Layer)
Limestone Mix
4244 Bitiuminous Concrete ton §76.50 $76.00
{3/8" Wearing Layer) '
Limestone Mix
4247 Bitiuminous Concrate ton $74.00 $73.00
(1/2" Wearing Layer)
Siliceous Mix
424A Bitiuminous Concrete ton $76.50 $76.00
(3/8" Wearing Layer)
Siliceous Mix
424B Bitiuminous Concrete ton $65.00 $59.00
{1" Upper Binder), Patching
Limestone Mix
4248 Bitiuminous Concrete ton $69.00 $64.00
- (3/4" Upper Binder), Patching
Limestone Mix
4248 Bitiuminous Concrete ton $71.00 $73.00

(1/2" Upper Binder), Leveling

Limestone Mix




COUNTY ENGINEER

TELEPHONE - (256) 332-8434
Jdson Baggett

EMAIL - jasonb@franklincountya!.org

Franklin County Highway Department
P.0. BOX 717
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35653

December 12, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
405 N Jackson Ave.
Russellville, AL 35653

RE:  Recommendation for Bid Award
Polypropylene Pipe (pp)

Dear Sir:

This letter is to recommend the above referenced bid be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,

whichis ] & G Culverts, Inc., as seen on the attached tabulation sheet. This bid will be effective
January 1 through December 31, 2024

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please contact me.

Sincerely,

i

Jason Baggett, PE
Franklin County

Franklin County, Alabama - Recreation Paradise
Land of Bear Creek Lakes



FRANKLIN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION SHEET FOR Polypropylene Pipe (PP)
BID DATE: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 at 2:00 pm
Effective: January 1 through December 31, 2024
Fallin

ADCO J&G A&L Farms
D Size Price/LF Price/LF Price/LF Price/LF
8101 12" $15.69 $12.75 NO BID NO BID
8102 15" $19.26 $17.50 NO BID NOBID |
8108 18" $24.55 $22.13 NO BID NO BID
8104 24" $41.39 $37.45 NO BID NO BID
8105 30" $64.44 $56.12 NO BID NO BID
8106 36" $70.55 $64.03 NO BID NO BID
8107 42" $95.14 $86.70 NQ BID NO BiD
8108 48" $124.77 $113.40 NO BID NO BID
8109 60" $195.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Note: J&G charges $100 delivery fee for orders under $2500.00




Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

EXTEND ADVERTISEMENT FOR ROADWAY MAINTENANCE TECHNICIAN I

It is on motion of Mr, Jason Miller, second by Mr. David Hester, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the board to approve to extend the advertisement for the Roadway Maintenance
Technician I position.

PROBATE OFFICE,

SOFTWARE

It is on motion of Mr. Jason Miller, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the board to approve the proposal from Assurance Software for the Probate
Office for a $25,000 initial fee and $1,800 monthly fee to be paid from the Probate Judge Index Fee
Fund. Chairman Moore stated that Assurance is also used by the Revenue Commission office and they
will work well together in sharing information.

Proposal as follows:



assurance

SOFTWARE

Software Installation Proposal

December 5, 2023

Submitted to: Franklin County Probate

Introduction

Assurance Software is pleased to offer as a comprehensive solution to Franklin County our Assurance Probate Land
Recording and Court suite of software products.

%“ e £ it : ;
Assurance Land $25,000 Includ
Recording/Court/Business

License/Boats

Assurance Probate Court $1,800
Monthly Maintenance

i

e T B
ing Included 3 days of onsite training will be provided in the initial installation cost.
Offsite Data Backup Included County should provide primary backups. We will be secondary.
Public Website Included  Public search website is included.

TOTAL ONE TIME COST: $25,000
TOTAL MONTHLY MAINTENANCE: $1,800



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

SHERIFE’S OFFICE/JAIL

HIRE TEMPORARY CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER

It is on motion of Mr, Chris Wallace, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve to hire Maddie Hairrell as a temporary Corrections
Officer/Dispatcher, effective November 30, 2023,

Letter as follows:



Counry SrErEr’s OFFicE

748 WALNUT GATE RoaAD

OFrFICE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

JAIL 256-332-8425
FAx 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

November 28, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
PO Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,

I'am hiring Maddie Hairrell as a temporary Correction Officer / Dispatcher.,
Effective November 30, 2023,




Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

HIRE DEPUTY

It is on motion of Mr, David Hester, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the Board to approve to table hiring a Deputy,

AMEND RESIGNATION OF OFFICE CLERK

It is on motion of Mr. Jason Miller, second by Mr. David Hester, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the Board to approve to amend the resignation date of Sheriff’s Office Clerk Samuel
Cosby to November 22, 2023.

Letter as follows:



FRANKLIN Counry SEERIEF’S OFEicE

748 WALNUT GATE Roap

OFrICE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

JAIL 256-332-8425
Fax 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

November 28, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
PO Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,

Samuel had 20 hours of vacation, which he used Monday November 20th eight (8)
hours, Tuesday November 21* eight (8) hours and Wednesday November 22nd
four (4) hours for a total of 20 hours. Samuel is not working the remainder of his
notice until December 1, 2023,

Sincerely,

annon Oliver
Sheriff



~ lwon't be there at all
this week. Staying

- homeandusingupall

. my vacation days




Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Régular Meeting

TRANSFER OF CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER TO OFFICE CLERK

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged

and decreed by the Board to approve the transfer of Corrections Officer/Dispatcher Amye Clay to Office
Clerk, effective December 11, 2023.

Letter as follows:



PRANILIN CouNTY SEERIEYS OrEicE

748 WALNUT GATE RoaD

OFrICE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

Jaw, 256-332-8425
Fax 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

November 28, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
County Commissioners
P.0.Box 1028
Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen:

[ am accepting a lateral transfer for Amye Clay going to office clerk from
Corrections Officer. Effective date December 11, 2023.

Sincerely,

Shannon Qliver
Sheriff



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

PROMOTION OF CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER TO SERGEANT

[t is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr, Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve to the promotion of Mathew Waldrep to Sergeant,
effective November 26, 2023.

Letter as follows:



County SEEREFS

748 WALNUT GATE RoAD

OFFICE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

JaiL 256-332-8425
Fax 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

November 28, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
PO Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,

['am promoting Matthew Waldrep from Correction / Dispatch Officer to
Sergeant Correction/ Dispatch. Effective November 26,2023.

Sincerely,

annon Oliver
Sheriff



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

HIRE PERMANENT CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the Board to approve to hire Case

y Cater as a permanent Corrections Officer/Dispatcher,
effective December 4, 2023,

Letter as follows:



Counry SemErmps Oerice

748 WALNUT GATE Roap

OFrriCcE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ArLABAMA 35654

JAIL 256-332-8425
EAx 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFE

November 30, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
Po Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,
After reviewing applications and conducting interviews, I am hiring Casey Carter

permanent full time as Corrections Officer /Dispatcher. Effective December 4,2023

Sincerely,

Sheriff



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

RESIGNATION OF CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve the resignation of Corrections Officer/Dispatcher Rikki
Tharp, effective November 11, 2023,

ADVERTISE FOR CORRECTIONS OFF ICER/DISPATCHER

It is on motion of Mr., Jason Miller, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,

adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve fo advertise for the vacant Corrections Officer/Dispatcher
position,

Letter as follows:



FRANKILIN COUunry SEERIEE

748 WALNUT GATE RoaD
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

8 OrpicE

Orrice 256-332-8811
JAIL 256-332-8425
Fax 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

November 30, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
PO Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,

['am accepting Rikki Tharp’s resignation effective November 11, 2023. Rikki did
notreport to work. I am requesting that you advertise for a Correction/ Dispatcher
position as soon as possible.

hannon
Sheriff



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

HIRE PERMANENT CORRECTIONS OFFICER/DISPATCHER

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged
and decreed by the Board to approve to hire Lucas Stonecipher as a permanent Corrections
Officer/Dispatcher, effective December 5, 2023.

Letter as follows:



Courry SrErEr’s OpFicE

748 WALNUT GATE RoAD

OFFICE 256-332-8811
RUSSELLVILLE, ALABAMA 35654

JaiL 256-332-8425
Fax 256-332-8816

SHANNON OLIVER
SHERIFF

December 5, 2023

Barry Moore, Chairman
Franklin County Commission
Po Box 1028

Russellville, AL 35653

Gentlemen,

After reviewing applications and conducting interviews, I am hiring Lucas Stonecipher
permanent full time as Corrections Officer /Dispatcher. Effective December 5, 2023,

Sincerely,

Shannon Oliver
Sheriff



Franklin County Commission December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

RESOLUTION TO USE LATCF FUNDS FOR AEDS

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. Jason Miller, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve to table the resolution to use LATCF funds for AEDs
until more information can be gathered.

SOLID WASTE

BIDS ON F150

It is on motion of Mr. Jason Miller, second by Mr. Chris Wallace, unanimously ordered,
adjudged and decreed by the Board to approve the highest responsible bidder on the 2006 Ford F150 to
JJ Merchant in the amount of $577.77.

Bid information as follows:



FRANKLIN COUNTY COMMISSION 7 o Chaiman

Chris Wallace, District I
P.O. Box 1028 - Russellville, AL 35653

Jason Miller, District I
Phone (256) 332-8850 - Fax (256) 332-8855 Joseph Baldwin, District 111

David Hester, District TV
Leah Mansell, Administrator

NOTICE OF INVITATION TO BID

The Franklin County Commission is accepting sealed bids for the sale of the following:

2006 Ford F150

Vehicle(s) sold “as is”.
Bids will be received until 4:00 PM on Friday, December 1, 2023, in the Franklin County
Commission Office. Bids may be delivered to the Franklin County Commission Office at

405 North Jackson Avenue between the hours of 8:00 AM and 5:00 PM, or mailed to
P.O. Box 1028, Russellville, AL 35653.

Bids should be marked “Bid on Ford F150".
Use attached tabulation sheet.

If you wish to view the items or have any questions, please contact Gene Ward at
(256) 460-9697.

Truck is to be removed within fourteen days from the date the bid is approved at no
cost to the Franklin County Commission.

Franklin County reserves the right to reject any or all bids.
Franklin County Commission is an equal opportunity employer and does not

discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age or
handicapped status in employment of the provision of services.



BID TABULATION SHEET

[tem Bid Price

2006 Ford F150 STE

T Merchant

Name

51 ﬁ\_’uck’- ¢d

Address

KPonis  tws 39415
City, State, ZIP

Lot ~laDl-303-2

Phone

Sié‘r{ature




BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Price

HSI O

lte

2006 Ford F150

L o rches s

Name

/4;0 /Z,cﬁ»”z,é?e/"“ = A pﬂ/\
Address

#DD@@_&, /QC,- 3”‘)F—‘“Shh7/

City, State, ZIP

Zﬁgqurﬁgr77

Phone

Y aer it oy

Signature




BID TABULATION SHEET

2006 Ford F150

Ko 1)

Name

o . /
e ([ Fhompen, JE.
Address

/}M‘M—v&(/wm/ C/CL TSeSS

City, State, ZIP

A 533 A 0% 05

Phone

Signature

< Bid Price
 —

i




Franklin County Commission

December 18, 2023 Regular Meeting

BIDS ON K250

It is on motion of Mr. David Hester, second by Mr, Jason Miller, unanimously ordered, adjudged

and decreed by the Board to approve the highest r
Merchant in the amount of $577.77.

Bid information as follows:

esponsible bidder on the 2008 Ford F25( to JJ



FRANKLIN COUNTY COMMISSION Barry Moore, Chairman

Chris Wallace, District I
P.O. Box 1028 - Russellville, AL 35653

Jason Miller, District IT
Phone (256) 332-8850 - Fax (256) 332-8855 Joseph Baldwin, District III

David Hester, District IV
Leah Mansell, Administrato

NOTICE OF INVITATION TO BID

The Franklin County Commission is accepting sealed bids for the sale of the following:

2008 Ford F250

Vehicle(s) sold “as is”.

Bids will be received until 4:00 PM on Friday, December 1, 2023, in the Franklin County Commission
Office. Bids may be delivered to the Franklin County Commission Office at 405 North Jackson Avenue
between the hours of 8:00 AM and 5:00 PM, or mailed to P.O. Box 1028, Russellville, AL 35653,

Bids should be marked “Bid on Ford F250”.

Use attached tabulation sheet.

If you wish to view the items or have any questions, please contact Gene Ward at (256) 460-9697.

Truck is to be removed within fourteen days from the date the bid is approved at no cost to the
Franklin County Commission.

Franklin County reserves the right to reject any or all bids.

Franklin County Commission is an equal opportunity employer and does not discriminate on the basis

of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age or handicapped status in employment of the provision
of services.



BID TABULATION SHEET

te Bid Price
2008 Ford F250 57 -

R MNerdngat "ngeﬁfb uhaan

Name

o) pt\l.fcoc.(t 2d
Address

’Purvis; WMS 3947145
City, State, ZIP

5}:3 me_rab\a,vuk sl e

Legl-—lnelo~3c:3& 3:m®

Phone

¥
igpature



BID TABULATION SHEET

ltem

Bid Price
2008 Ford F250 4 S, po

IRt /pézéaéO/Jgﬁ_

Name

(2O RoSer B fee =2
Address

HoDses Ae 357,
City, State, ZIP

2oL Y9~ Egdp 7

Phone

ety airen o,

Signature




BID TABULATION SHEET
——2VLATION SHEET

ltem

2008 Ford F250

=c> /7
Address

T dibhe [ (U 35053
City,

State, ZIP

;25(_(?\3%2«02 2 <

Phone

\/%r/m - \f_a vz&ﬂ__g;__

Signature

Bid Price
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ADJOURNMENT

Chairman Moore thanked everyone for attending the meeting and wished them a Merry
Christmas and Happy New Year.

It is on motion of Mr. Chris Wallace, second by Mr. Jason Miller, that the meeting be adjourned

i Wallace, District [

) WL

Jagon Miller, District I -

Absent YO A4

=T

Joseph Bald 1, Districy

¥
David gester, District 1V



